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Mumbai, August 16, 2023  
Brenntag Specialties presents natural, healthy and sustainable solutions at 
India’s largest food and ingredients event 
 
Brenntag, the global market leader in chemicals and ingredients distribution, 
is participating at the upcoming Fi India (Food Ingredients India) 2023 which 
will be co-located with ProPak India, bringing together local and global 
tastemakers at one dedicated event to address India’s burgeoning food and 
ingredients market.  
 
Fi India will be taking place from August 17 - 19 at the Bombay Exhibition 
Centre in Mumbai, India. The theme of the Brenntag booth (Hall 1, stand A08) 
is “Natural, Healthy and Sustainable”, showcasing Brenntag Nutrition 
division’s technical expertise, tailor-made formulation and applications 
addressing various segments such as bakery, beverages, confectionary, 
nutraceuticals, vegan and dairy.  
 
“We are thrilled to delight our visitors to experience food and beverage 
applications like mayonnaise, gummies, green tea, vegan cakes, and vegan 
drinks using natural, healthy and sustainable solutions with immunity-
boosting, anti-inflammatory and gut health protection properties,” said 
Lokesh MA, Regional Commercial Director of Nutrition for South Asia, 
Brenntag Ingredients India Private Limited. 
 

About Brenntag: 

Brenntag is the global market leader in chemicals and ingredients 
distribution. The company holds a central role in connecting customers and 
suppliers of the chemical industry. Headquartered in Essen, Germany, 
Brenntag has more than 17,500 employees worldwide and operates a 
network of about 600 sites in 72 countries. In 2022, Brenntag generated sales 
of around 19.4 billion EUR. The two global divisions, Brenntag Essentials and 
Brenntag Specialties, provide a full-line portfolio of industrial and specialty 
chemicals and ingredients as well as tailor-made application, marketing and 
supply chain solutions, technical and formulation support, comprehensive 
regulatory know-how, and digital solutions for a wide range of industries. In 
the field of sustainability, Brenntag pursues specific goals and is committed 
to sustainable solutions in its own sector and the industries served. Brenntag 
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shares have been listed at the Frankfurt Stock Exchange since 2010, in the 
DAX since September 2021. In addition, the Brenntag SE shares are listed in 
the DAX 50 ESG and DAX ESG Target. For more information, visit 
www.brenntag.com  
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